Reg. No. GR/RNP/GOA/32 RNI No. GOAENG/2002/6410

Panaji, 1st July, 2011 (Ashada 10, 1933) ﬁ SERIES | No. 13

OFFICIAL " GAZETTE
GOVERNMENT OF GOA

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

EXTRAORDINARY

GOVERNMENT OF GOA

Department of Finance

02! Wé‘
0/’“ \\\V///

Revenue & Control Division

Notification
4/5/2005-Fin (R&C)(88)

In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (4) of Section 5 of the Goa Value Added
Tax Act, 2005 (Goa Act 9 of 2005) (hereinafter referred to as the “said Act”) and all other powers
enabling it in this behalf, the Government of Goa hereby amends Schedule ‘C’ appended to the
said Act, as follows, namely:—

In Schedule ‘C’ appended to the said Act,—

(i) against entry at serial number (4), in column (3), for the figures “20%", the figures “18%" shall be
substituted,;

(ii) against entry at serial number (8), in column (3), for the figures “22%", the figures “20%" shall be
substituted,;

This Notification shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Goa.
Ajit S. Pawasker, Under Secretary, Finance (R&C).

Porvorim, 30th June, 2011.

www.goaprintingpress.gov.in

Printed and Published by the Director, Printing & Stationery,
Government Printing Press,
Mahatma Gandhi Road, Panaji-Goa 403 001.

PRICE - Rs. 1.00

131



